
THE LIFE STORY OF —

Mark A.
Zimmerman, 20

WESTPHALIA — Mark
Aloysius Zimmerman, son of
Roman and Patricia Sullivan
Zimmerman was born in Manilla
on April 23, 1957. He died at his
home in Omaha, Nebr., on Aug.
23, 1977 at age 20 years and four
months. He was baptized and
confirmed at the Sacred Heart
Catholic church in Manilla. He
grew up in Manilla, attending
grade school and the Manilla high
school through his junior yearJHe
then attended Kuemper nigh
school in Carroll, where he
graduated in 1975. Mark attended
North West Missouri State College
in Maryville, Mo., for a year
before moving to Omaha, Nebr.,
in the fall of 1976. This has been
his home since that time. He was
a member of the Sacred Heart
Catholic church in Manilla.

He was preceded in death by
his mother. His survivors include
his father and step-mother, Mr
and Mrs Roman Zimmerman of
Oakland, five brothers - Joseph of

, Des Moines, Melvin of LaVista,
i Nebr., James of Baldwin City,
I Kans., Elmer of Sioux City and

Gerald of Ralston, Nebr., two
nephews, Mike and Steve and
other relatives.

A Mass of Christian Burial
was celebrated at St. Boniface
Catholic church in Westphalia, on
Friday, Aug. 26, 1977, with Rev.
Joseph A. Devlin, pastor of St.
Mary's church in Red Oak, as
celebrant. Burial was at St.
Boniface cemetery with Chris
Gaul, David Gaul, John Sullivan,
Rae Zimmerman, Glen Zim-
merman and William Monahan
serving as pallbearers.


